Exhibit E



Staffing Services for School Nursing
Summary of Cost Proposals
Opened on 1/4/2018

CATEGORY
1. Supplemental BPS Nursing Staff
Medical Director (annual cost)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
Nurse Practitioners (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
Medical Assistants (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

2. BPS Schools

Nursing Supervisor (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Registered Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Licensed Practical Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

RFP 18-0621E2-041

Ardor Health
Solutions

No Bid

60
60
60

57
57
57

50
50
50

Bond Health

Staffing

No Bid

92
92
92

24
24
24

68
68
68

66
66
66

42
42
42

Clinical
Staffing
Resources

No Bid

110
110
110

24
24
24

56
56
56

52.50
52.50
52.50

37.50
37.50
37.50

Delta T
GroupNorth
Jersey Group

No Bid

75000
75000
75000

42
43
44

32
33
34

EDU

No Bid

Healthcare

60
60
60

50
50
50

45
45
45

Kaleida
Health

117/46640
120/48039
124/49480

89/277528
92/285854
94/294430

33/108662
34/111922
35/115280

46/55443
47/57106
49/58819

63/4098061
65/4221003
67/4347633

47/641705
48/660956
49/680785

Medical
Staffing
Network

136500
140595
144812.85

100
103
106.69

27
27.81
28.64

60
61.80
63.65

58
59.74
61.53

38
39.14
40.31

Healthcare

PSA

No Bid

62
63.86
65.77

47.74
49.17
50.64

35.02
36.07
37.15

Sunbelt
Staffing, LLC

163800
168714
173775

77
79.31
81.69

28
28.84
29.71

56
57.68
59.41

54
55.62
57.29

34
35.02
36.07

Supplemental
Healthcare

No Bid

62
64
66

55
57
59

45
47
49

WorkFit
Medical

145000
150800
156832

99.50
103.48
107.62

26.50
27.56
28.66

62.90
65.42
68.03

56.75
59.02
61.38

39.85
41.44
43.10

Worldwide

Travel
Staffing

396000
396000
396000

175
175
175

36
37
38

72
74
76

68
70
72

58
60
62

Maxim

No
Bid

New Wave
People

No
Bid

WNY

No
Bid

Immediate

Care




Staffing Services for School Nursing
Summary of Cost Proposals
Opened on 1/4/2018

3. Charter Schools

Nursing Supervisor (annual cost)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Registered Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Licensed Practical Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

4. Private and Parochial

Nursing Supervisor (annual cost)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Registered Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Licensed Practical Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

RFP 18-0621E2-041

Ardor Health
Solutions

No Bid

No Bid

Bond Health

Staffing

92320
92320
92320

66
65
66

42
40
40

92320
92320
92320

66
65
66

42
40
40

Clinical

Staffing
Resources

52.50
52.50
52.50

37.50
37.50
37.50

52.50
52.50
52.50

37.50
37.50
37.50

Delta T

GroupNorth
Jersey Group

75000
75000
75000

42
43
44

32
33
43

75000
75000
75000

42
43
44

32
33
44

EDU

Healthcare

60
60
60

50
50
50

45
45
45

60
60
60

50
50
50

45
45
45

Kaleida
Health

46/2672
47/2752
49/2835

63/197497
65/203422
67/209524

47/30926
48/31853
49/32809

46/8684
47/8944
49/9213

63/641865
65/661121
67/680955

47/100508
48/103523
49/106629

Medical
Staffing
Network

64800
66744
68746.32

58
59.74
61.53

38
39.14
40.31

64800
66744
68746.32

58
59.74
61.53

38
39.14
40.31

Healthcare

PSA

104656
107795.68
111029.55

47.74
49.17
50.64

35.02
36.07
37.15

104656
107795.68
111029.55

47.74
49.17
50.64

35.02
36.07
37.15

Sunbelt
Staffing, LLC

79200
81576
84023

54
55.62
57.29

34
35.02
36.07

79200
81576
84023

54
55.62
57.29

34
35.02
36.07

Supplemental
Healthcare

62
64
66

55
57
59

45
47
49

62
64
66

55
57
59

45
47
49

WorkFit
Medical

130832
136065.28
141507.89

56.75
59.02
61.38

39.85
41.44
43.10

130832
136065.28
141507.89

56.75
59.02
61.38

39.85
41.44
43.10

Worldwide

Travel
Staffing

105000
107000
109000

68
70
72

58
60
62

105000
107000
109000

68
70
72

58
60
62

Maxim

New Wave
People

WNY

Immediate

Care




Staffing Services for School Nursing
Summary of Cost Proposals
Opened on 1/4/2018

5. Field Trip

Registered Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

Licensed Practical Nurses (hourly rate)
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3

6. Supplies % Markup on Cost
Year 1
Year 2
Year 3
PROBLEMS:
Clinical Staffing was delayed by Bombcyclone
Kaleida was late
Kaleida is all or nothing
Kaleida did not submit cost proposal as requested

Kaleida included additional title & costs for category 1:

Coordinator/Assistant Supervisor
Yr134/98315
Yr 2 35/101265
Yr 336/104303
Maxim's proposal was late
Maxim's cost proposal was missing from packet
Maxim did not submit an electronic copy
Maxim only submited 1 hard copy

RFP 18-0621E2-041

Ardor Health
Solutions

No Bid

No Bid

Bond Health

Staffing

65
65
66

42
40
40

o

Clinical

Staffing
Resources

52.50
52.50
52.50

37.50
37.50
37.50

Delta T

GroupNorth

Jersey Group

43
44

32
33
44

o

EDU

No Bid

Healthcare

50
50
50

45
45
45

Kaleida
Health

No Bid

0/33000
0/33660
0/34333

Medical

Staffing
Network

58
59.74
61.53

38
39.14
40.31

25
25
25

Healthcare

PSA

47.74
49.17
50.64

35.02
36.07
37.15

No Bid

Sunbelt

No Bid

No Bid

Staffing, LLC

Supplemental
Healthcare

55
57
59

45
47
49

o

WorkFit
Medical

56.75
59.02
61.38

39.85
41.44
43.10

Worldwide
Travel

No Bid

Staffing

Maxim

New Wave
People

WNY

Immediate

Care




